From: Dominic Fahey <dominic_fahey@yahoo.com>

Sent: 01 October 2024 20:51

To: Terry Smith <terrysmithuk@gmail.com>; Keith Steer <keithsteer@gmail.com>
Subject: Fw: Sheltered Water Leader Assessment

Hi

As discussed I've paid £200 the deposit for.
the 1 day assessment £200 per person per
day

Im hoping as there is only 2 of us we can
complete both sections in a day doing the
grade 1 river section on the Dee and then the
shelter water at Bala

If weather requires cancelling we can move it
to Easter holiday

In the mean time we need to look for some
volunteers to be lead in a mix of tooring boats
& open boat for the 30th of October

Cheers

Dom

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

On Tuesday, October 1, 2024, 4:13 PM, TNR
Outdoors <hello@tnroutdoors.co.uk> wrote:

it (KEVED)

Hi Dominic,

Thanks so much for your call just now.
To confirm, you have now paid your
£200 deposit for the Sheltered Water
Leader Assessment on 30th October.
(receipt attached)

This leaves an outstanding balance of
£200 to be paid before the 30th
October.

Rich, your assessor, will be in touch closer to the time to arrange locations/timings and
things.



