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website@liverpoolcanoeclub.co.uk

From: Callum Cook <callumcook2000@gmail.com>
Sent: 08 September 2025 22:08
To: Keith Steer; website@liverpoolcanoeclub.co.uk
Subject: Re: Polo BA and Goal Nets

Attached polo net invoice 
 

 
 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
 
 

On 8 Sep 2025, at 20:31, Callum Cook <callumcook2000@gmail.com> wrote: 

 
Attached both invoices for polo BA and Nets 
 
Polo BA's: 
Total price for 16 BA's = £1984.04 
10 Club Ba's = £1,240 
 
Polo Nets: 
£110 
 
Total: £1350 
 
Bank Transfer Details: 
Name: Callum Cook Account No:89720706  Sort Code: 09-01-28 
 
Cheers, 
Callum C 
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Attached invoice for both: 
http://www.canoepolozone.com/goalnets.html 
<Inv00107992.pdf> 


